
"SOME OF US ARE UNSURE OF JUST HOW FAR WE DARE STEP OUT." 

SEPARATE TRAINING 
SESSIONS 

FOR WOMEN? 

BY ALMA 
BARON 

As she entered the meeting room, 
I could tell she was angry. I greet-
ed her as I do all of the seminar 
students: "Good morning, I'm 
Alma Baron, the coordinator of 
this seminar." "Good morning," 
she replied, looking around the 
room. "All good little girls here, I 
suppose, following their bosses' 
orders?" "Well," I laughingly re-
plied, "this is a women's seminar." 
She looked at me, took her name 
tag and found a seat at one of the 
participant tables. 

As others arrived, I forgot my 
first impression of her in the rush 
of the greetings, directions and 
orientation. Participants then be-
gan introducing themselves. Most 
said it was their first training sem-
inar. When asked, as was part of 
the introduction routine, what 
they expected to gain from the ex-
perience, many responded that 
they expected to be able to per-
form their management job better 
after the course. Two of the 35 
members expressed the controlled 
anger I saw in the early arrival: 
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"I can't see why women have to 
be trained separately. Seems to 
me if we work with men we should 
be trained with them," was one 
comment. 

The woman whom I mentioned 
when I opened this article was 
even more vocal in her criticism: 

"Women are a pain," she said. (I 
admired her courage in saying this 
in front of 34 strangers.) "I don't 
trust women and I frankly will say 
that I think these three days will 
be a waste of time. I have nothing 
to learn from other women. I'm on 
a fast track to the top, and this 
isn't going to help!" 

Silence greeted her outburst. I 
hastened to try and clear the air by 
saying, "Everyone's entitled to 
their opinion. How about giving 
yourself a chance to change your 
mind? I've found, with about seven 
years' experience of women's sem-
inars behind me, that people who 
come in as you do with a negative 
attitude toward this type of contin-
uing education often have a differ-
ent opinion when it's over. We'll all 
try to prove you're wrong." 

The incidents I described are all 
true. Over the years, about 10 per 

cent of the attendants in a women's 
seminar have objected to the all-
women designation. I have wres-
tled with the problem myself — 
the problem of women working 
with men and being trained separ-
ately. 

In 1973, I wrote an article deal-
ing with the problem. Today my 
ideas have not changed, only 
become reinforced. Please read the 
following letter: 

"Dear Alma: I was concerned 
when I heard you say that in the 
future you would consider cutting 
back on women's extension cours-
es. If I understood correctly, you 
felt there was a need for men and 
women to come together to study 
management skills. If I am wrong 
in this statement, please forgive 
me. That prospect did prompt me 
to write this letter so that I might 
attempt to tell you in part what the 
seminar did for me beyond the aca-
demic. 

"The seminar took us far beyond 
the academic subject. It was a 
meeting place where women could 
share their problems and triumphs. 
A place where women could meet 
and learn from each other. I know 



this is not news to you, but I want 
to remind you that we are many, 
and we are mere infants. I want 
what you and other women can 
teach me. Men have taught me all 
my life but they have taught me 
limitation. You and other women 
like you teach me there are no 
limits. 

"Where else can I learn and be 
as free? Where can I communicate 
my business life so freely with 
other women? Where else would 
anyone be as interested in what I 
do and how I do it? When I meet 
with my professional peers they 
know I belong there because they 
have seen my credentials. We do 
not share with each other nor do 
we admit our ignorance. We come 
dressed as professional business 
women and do not forget our roles. 

"Women need to share their suc-
cesses without fear of competition 
or scorn. We benefit from sharing 
our successes by learning of oppor-
tunities open to women that we 
might have previously considered 
closed. Some of us are unsure of 
just how far we dare step out. We 

can create dreams of attainment 
for each other. If I say to a man, 'I 
have a corporate car,' he lifts one 
eyebrow and thinks, ' the dumb 
broad, doesn't she know I've had 
one for 20 years?' If I say to an-
other woman, 'I drive a company 
car,' she may think, 'if she can, 
maybe I can.' If I explain the 
financial benefits of a company car, 
she will see the dollar value as re-
lates to her salary. She now has a 
financial goal and a dream of 
attainment. A dream to be made 
real? If a Catholic nun can write a 
Harlequin Romance, can I then 
possibly write a trade magazine 
article? A dream to be made real? 
Without the particular atmosphere 
of this seminar, I would never 
know of the dream, let alone dare 
to dream. 

"Let me learn from you and my 
sisters in the classroom. Let me 
take away what I have learned to 
use in competing on my home 
ground. I don't want to compete in 
the classroom. 

"Alma, I cannot adequately put 
into words all that I gained from 
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this seminar. All the presenters 
showed us such tremendous enthu-
siasm and courage. I hope you are 
able to take great pleasure in lead-
ing women in continuing growth. 
Thank you for thi£ experience. 
Sincerely, Norma Blackwood, Chi-
cago, Illinois." 

Since 1973, the number of wo-
men taking seminars especially for 
women has more than doubled at 
Management Institute. Three new 
seminars have been added, and the 
number of times these seminars 
are held has been stepped up. In 
essence, hundreds of women are 
attending these courses. Each time 
a course is announced, the enroll-
ment grows. Many people are 
placed on a waiting list for months 
in order to gain admission into a 
particular seminar. This, by itself, 
should indicate that women are 
responding to these seminars be-
cause they believe that they are 
valuable. I have at times doubted 
the so-called success of the sheer 
numbers of these seminars. Using 
the research that I finished myself, 
I sometimes assumed that man-
agers were sending women to 
these seminars as a paliative for 
their training experiences. But the 
women returned for other semin-
ars at their own insistence. 

This is another plus for continu-
ing the separate programs. But 
more than the fact that women get 
to interface with other women for 
the first time, as so poignantly ex-
pressed by Norma, is the fact that 
they learn from models. Modeling 
has been denied women in man-
agement. Oh no, it wasn't discrim-
ination, it was simply the lack of 
women in management positions 
when younger women could ob-
serve and model. My cursory re-
search (ongoing by constant ques-
tioning of my students) yields the 
interesting and logical data that 
women who have others as models, 
had the mother working in a tradi-
tional role. "Oh yes," they re-
spond. "My mother always work-
ed, but she was a teacher — a 
nurse — a storekeeper — a secre-
tary. " Not once have I had a parti-
cipant tell me that her mother was 
in a management job, unless she 
owned the company, usually with 
the father. 
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"The young women in our culture who aspired 
to management positions have no chance 

to absorb behavior for their expectant role." 

The modeling aspect of learning 
a new social routine has long been 
acknowledged among educators as 
one of the most potent learning 
experiences in existence. Each of 
us is socialized into our culture by 
observation and subconscious ab-
sorption of social routines we live 
with. We learn to eat properly, to 
dress properly, to address one 
another properly, to perform and 
do countless verbal and nonverbal 
courtesies by simply watching and 
copying those around us. When I 
use the word "properly," I refer to 
that which is acceptable in our 
culture that identifies who we are 
— boy and girl, young adolescent, 
young adult and so on. 

Those of us who do not absorb 
these routines without conscious 
teaching become "special." Some 
of our "specials" are institutional-
ized because they are so deviant. 
The majority of us reform the 
social level into which we have 

been born, and we continue to 
mature through formal education 
and experience. The young women 
in our culture who aspired to man-
agement positions have no chance 
to absorb behavior for their expec-
tant role. They really cannot model 
their fathers (although many have 
tried) because to do so causes 
great ambiguity among the wo-
men; they are not men. They need 
a successful, feminine model and, 
until a very short time ago, few if 
any such models existed. 

Training courses for women in 
management offer models. Not one 
of the women attending is the 
paragon of a successful woman 
manager. But among all of them 
attending a potpourri of experi-
ence, behavior patterns and com-
municative techniques are ex-
posed. A woman attendee then can 
pick and choose from a variety of 
models and she often does. I have 
received countless letters saying 
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that the courses helped them to 
understand what a powerful sup-
port a group of women can be. I 
have received letters which indi-
cate promotions reached and job 
enrichment realized simply be-
cause the women picked up on tips 
from other women. I have received 
testimonials for women from other 
women that cause men's camara-
derie to pale in comparison. Wo-
men love the company of other 
women! 

Is this surprising? I think not; I 
simply think it's a new phenomen-
on. Women have never had the 
company of other women before. 
Women related to other women as 
wives of a couple. Women didn't 
have women as close companions 
once they married. (Somehow 
marriage precluded close friend-
ships between women.) Women 
didn't trust other women because 
they never had a chance to know 
other women in any great number. 
Now, as a network is forming, wo-
men are finding themselves in the 
minds and hearts and aspirations 
of the women they meet in ever 
larger numbers. 

I responded to Norma and her 
beautiful letter: "Yes, I shall con-
tinue to plan safe and non-threat-
ening sessions for women as long 
as they identify them as useful. I'm 
excited to see that a self-confident 
woman can work constructively 
with both sexes. I'm excited to see 
self-confidence grow in our emerg-
ing woman manager. Such confi-
dence, in both men and women, 
can only brighten the work place 
and all of us look forward to that!" 

Alma Baron is associate professor of 
Management, Management Institute, 
Department of Business and Manage-
ment, University of Wisconsin - Exten-
sion, Madison. Presently, she coordin-
ates, teaches and has initiated all the 
programs for the emerging woman man-
ager. She also is the coordinator for the 
Executive and Administrative Programs 
for Secretaries, which lead to the Execu-
tive Secretarial Administrative Degree. 
She is a consultant to many major cor-
porations throughout the United States, 
and has been guest lecturer abroad 
several times. 
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