
Board rooms and factory floors 
across organizational America 
reverberated with one word dur-

ing 1983: Excellence. The American 
Society for Training and Development 
was no different. In Search of Excellence 
was a best seller in the Society's 
publishing program. The training and 
development competency study and the 
National Conference were developed 
around the theme of modeling ex-
cellence. The concept became a unify-
ing goal and benchmark for all ASTD 
activities throughout the year. 

During 1983, ASTD—at national head-
quarters and in the field—was 
characterized by excitement and activity, 
by well directed, hard work; by having 
firm directions in hand and making 
strides toward well-defined goals. It was 
a year of moving toward excellence. 

For the field at large, 1983 saw atten-
tion focused sharply on human resource 
development issues. Week after week, 
national magazines like Fortune, Time 
and U.S. News and World Report 
featured cover stories concerning the 
challenges of retraining workers for high-
tech jobs, of developing a productive 
work force of individuals sorely lacking 

basic skills. 
ASTD members were in a hotter and 

hotter spotlight as the year progressed, 
and they needed more and more help 
from their Society. They needed a 
strong, unified national voice; a better 
sense of the size and scope of their pro-
fession's work; more sophisticated ways 
to assess their competence; a host of 
basic and cutting-edge professional 
development events and tools. 

ASTD responded to these needs with 
unprecedented depth and range. The 
Society published the landmark Models 
for Excellence: The Conclusions and 
Recommendations of the ASTD Training 
and Development Competency Study; 
implemented the Member Information 
Exchange, a critical new professional 
development tool; established a far-
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reaching national issues agenda; pub-
lished an important examination of the 
size and scope of the training and 
development field; and undertook a ma-
jor research project to identify accurate, 
efficient data-gathering methods for the 

field. 
The Society began surveying 

members as part of a major new pro-
duct development effort; voted to imple-
ment a new governance structure that 
will better support ASTD's strategic 
directions; expanded its chapter services 
activities; produced the largest and best 
professional development event for the 
field—the National Conference and Ex-
position; plus continued to expand and 
improve dozens of ASTD's traditional 
member products, services and activities. 

While ASTD made impressive pro-
gress on a number of fronts, the Society 
and the field still face many tough issues 
and unsolved problems. But 1983 will 
be remembered as a year of well fo-
cused resources and dynamic action for 
this Society, whose members' work is so 
critical to our nation's social and 
economic health. 
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